

The Library
University of East Anglia
Norwich Research Park
Norwich NR4 7TJ
United Kingdom

Email: foi@uea.ac.uk
Tel: +44 (0) 1603 592 431
Fax: +44 (0) 1603 591 010
Web: <http://www.uea.ac.uk>

02 October 2014

Dear [REDACTED]

Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Information request (ref: FOI_14-191)

We have now considered your request of 22 September 2014 for information relating to the University's LLB and GDL courses. Our response is on page 2 of this letter, together with a copy of your original request, and we hope this meets your requirements.

However, it is not possible to provide all the requested information. In line with your rights under section 1(1)(a) of the Act to be informed whether information is held, we confirm that the University does not hold information in response to your first and fifth questions.

Please note that any material over which UEA has copyright is released on the understanding that you will comply with all relevant copyright rules regarding reproduction and/or transmission of the information provided.

You have the right of appeal against this decision. If you wish to appeal, please set out in writing your reasons for appealing and send to the above address.

You must appeal our decision within 60 calendar days of the date of this letter. Any appeal received after that date will not be considered nor acknowledged. This policy has been reviewed and approved by the Information Commissioner's Office.

You also have a subsequent right of appeal to the Information Commissioner's Office. Further information is available on their website:

https://ico.org.uk/Global/contact_us, or by telephone on 0303 123 1113.

Please quote our reference given at the head of this letter in all correspondence.

Yours sincerely

Ellen Paterson
Information Policy and Compliance Manager
University of East Anglia

Response to Freedom of Information Act 2000 request (FOI_14-191)

1. For each of the LLB subjects taught at the University the dates of examinations taking place between March 1st and June 30th 2015.

[Information not held - s.1(1)(a), Freedom of Information Act]

2. If the University does not currently hold information about the precise exam dates then please provide the most precise information currently held regarding the dates of the exam period or periods during which the LLB examinations will take place.

The exam period is scheduled for 27 April – 5 June 2015.

3. A list of those LLB subjects (if any) which are not assessed by examination between March 1st and June 30th 2015.

The following LLB subjects are not assessed by examination:

- British Human Rights Law
- Company Law
- Comparative Law
- Competition Law
- Constitutional & Administrative Law
- Development Skills (Year 1)
- Development Skills (Year 2)
- Discrimination Law
- Dissertation
- English Legal Process
- EU Law
- Family Law: Adult Relationships
- International Humanitarian Law & Refugee Law
- Internet Law
- Introduction to American Law
- Jurisprudence
- Land Law
- Law in Practice
- Media Law
- The Law of Restitution
- The Law of Trusts

4. The LLB term dates for academic year 2014 - 2015

22 Sept to 12 Dec 2014, 12 Jan to 20 March 2015 then 13-24 April 2015, 27 April to 5 June 2015.

5. For each of the GDL (PGDL, CPE) subjects taught at the University the dates of examinations taking place between March 1st and June 30th 2015.

[Information not held - s.1(1)(a), Freedom of Information Act]

6. If the University does not currently hold information about the precise exam dates then please provide the most precise information currently held regarding the dates of the exam period or periods during which the GDL (PGDL, CPE) examinations will take place.

See answer to question 2.

7. A list of those GDL (PGDL, CPE) subjects, if any, which are not assessed by examination between March 1st and June 30th 2015.

The following GDL module is not assessed by examination:

- Research Project (Grad Dip)

8. The GDL (PGDL, CPE) term dates for academic year 2014 – 2015

The term dates are the same as for question 4, plus a pre-sessional period which started on 08 September 2014.