Information Services Directorate
The L brary
University of East Anglia
Norwich Research Park
Norwich NR4 7TJ
United Kingdom

26 November 2015

Email: foi@uea.ac.uk
Tel: +44 (0) 1603 592 431
Fax: +44 (0) 1603 591 010
Web: http://www.uea.ac.uk

Dear
Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Information request (ref: FOI_15-230)
We have now considered your request of 09 November 2015 (amended on 20
November) for the following information:
‘…an (annonymized) list of undergraduates who graduated last summer. If
possible, I would like the following information about them:
1.

2.
3.
4.

The type of school which they came from (e.g, Independent,
Comprehensive, Grammar, Sixth Form College) and whether these
were fee-paying schools or not.
What degree classification they were awarded (i.e. 1st, 2.1, 2.2 etc)
What subject they studied (or if not possible, what department they
were in)
How many UCAS points they had when they started their degree.’ [As
confirmed on 20 November, UCAS tariff banding rather than specific
points is acceptable]

As requested, our response is provided in the accompanying Excel spreadsheet,
FOI_15-230 Appendix A. The spreadsheet also contains notes on the data provided.
We hope this information meets your requirements, however it is not possible to
provide all the requested information. In line with your rights under section 1(1)(a) of
the Act to be informed whether information is held, we confirm that the University
does not hold information on whether the feeder schools were fee paying or not. In
addition, we do not hold UCAS tariff banding or feeder school data for all students.
You have the right of appeal against this response. If you wish to appeal, please set
out in writing your reasons for appealing and send to the above address. You must
appeal within 60 calendar days of the date of this letter. Any appeal received after
that date will not be considered nor acknowledged. This policy has been reviewed
and approved by the Information Commissioner’s Office.
You also have a subsequent right of appeal to the Information Commissioner’s
Office. Further information is available on their website:
https://ico.org.uk/Global/contact us, or by telephone on 0303 123 1113.
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Please note that any material over which UEA has copyright is released on the
understanding that you will comply with all relevant copyright rules regarding
reproduction and/or transmission of the information provided.
Please quote our reference given at the head of this letter in all correspondence.
Yours sincerely
Ellen Paterson
Information Policy and Compliance Manager
University of East Anglia
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