

[REDACTED]

08 May 2019

Dear [REDACTED]

**Freedom of Information Act 2000– Information request (ref: FOI\_19-113)**

We have now considered your request of 12 April 2019 for information relating to UCAT scores for the undergraduate medicine course at UEA.

Our response is on page 2 and 3 of this letter, together with a copy of your request.

On this occasion it is not possible to provide all the requested information. In line with your rights under section 1(1)(a) of the Act to be informed whether information is held, we confirm that the University does not hold any information relevant to questions c) and d) of your request nor some of the information requested in questions b) and e). Further details are provided on page 3.

We hope this information will meet your requirements, however if you are not satisfied you have the right of appeal. If you wish to appeal, please set out in writing your reasons for appealing and send to the above address. You must appeal within 40 working days of the date of this letter. In line with section 5.3 of the UK Government's Freedom of Information Act Code of Practice, we are not obliged to accept internal reviews after this date.

You also have a subsequent right of appeal to the Information Commissioner's Office. Further information is available on their website:

[https://ico.org.uk/Global/contact\\_us](https://ico.org.uk/Global/contact_us), or by telephone on 0303 123 1113.

Please note that any material over which UEA has copyright is released on the understanding that you will comply with all relevant copyright rules regarding reproduction and/or transmission of the information provided.

Please quote our reference given at the head of this letter in all correspondence.

Yours sincerely

Kirsty McDonald  
Information Compliance Assistant  
University of East Anglia

## Response to Freedom of Information Act 2000 request (FOI\_19-113)

*I have a few questions regarding the admissions statistics for the undergraduate medicine course. If you are not able to provide answers to the questions could you direct me to the Freedom of Information officer at UEA so I can make a request to them.*

*Would it be possible to have admissions statistics regarding:*

*a) The lowest and highest overall UKCAT scores to be invited to interview for 2017 and 2018 entry (please also include 2019 entry if you have that available). Please provide separate figures for Home and Overseas fee students if possible.*

Our response is in the table below:

Entry Year	Home/EU		International	
	Lowest UCAT score	Highest UCAT score	Lowest UCAT score	Highest UCAT score
2019	2,030	3,200	2,040	3,270
2018	2,150	3,320	2,230	3,020
2017	1,600	2,570	1,580	2,270

*b) The lowest and highest overall UKCAT scores to be given an offer for 2017 and 2018 entry (please also include 2019 entry if you have that available). Please provide separate figures for Home and Overseas fee students if possible.*

Our response is in the table below:

Entry Year	Home/EU		International	
	Lowest UCAT score	Highest UCAT score	Lowest UCAT score	Highest UCAT score
2019	<b>[Information not held - s.1(1)(a), Freedom of Information Act]</b>			
2018	2,340	3,320	2,540	3,020
2017	1,760	2,570	1,760	2,270

Information is not available for 2019 as there are outstanding decisions to be made on applications; therefore we have neither a lowest nor highest score as yet.

*c) The cut-off UKCAT scores for invitation to interview for 2017 and 2018 entry (please also include 2019 entry if you have that available), if you use cut-off scores. Please provide separate figures for Home and Overseas fee students if possible.*

**[Information not held - s.1(1)(a), Freedom of Information Act]**

The University does not have a cut-off UKCAT score for invitation to interview.

d) *The cut-off SJT band for invitation to interview.*

**[Information not held - s.1(1)(a), Freedom of Information Act]**

The University does not have a cut-off SJT band for invitation to interview.

e) *The number of offers you aim to make to Overseas fee paying students in 2020 (and what the number has been in previous years)*

**[Information not held - s.1(1)(a), Freedom of Information Act]**

The University does not hold a number for intended offers for 2020. In 2018, 21 offers were made and in 2017 42 offers were made. For 2019, so far, 24 offers have been made.