



University of East Anglia

Information Compliance (ITCS)

The Library
University of East Anglia
Norwich Research Park
Norwich NR4 7TJ
United Kingdom

Email: foi@uea.ac.uk
Tel: +44 (0) 1603 593 523
Fax: +44 (0) 1603 591 010
Web: <http://www.uea.ac.uk>

06 June 2018

Dear [REDACTED]

Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Information request (ref: FOI_18-109)

We have now considered your request of 08 May 2018 for information relating to the University's energy supply.

Our response is on page 2 of this letter, together with a copy of your request.

On this occasion it is not possible to provide the requested information. In line with your rights under section 1(1)(a) of the Act to be informed whether information is held, we confirm that the University does not hold information in relation to question 2 of your request. Further information is on page 2 of this letter.

We hope this information will meet your requirements, however if you are not satisfied you have the right of appeal. If you wish to appeal, please set out in writing your reasons for appealing and send to the above address. You must appeal within 60 calendar days of the date of this letter. Any appeal received after that date will not be considered nor acknowledged. This policy has been reviewed and approved by the Information Commissioner's Office.

You also have a subsequent right of appeal to the Information Commissioner's Office. Further information is available on their website:

https://ico.org.uk/Global/contact_us, or by telephone on 0303 123 1113.

Please note that any material over which UEA has copyright is released on the understanding that you will comply with all relevant copyright rules regarding reproduction and/or transmission of the information provided.

Please quote our reference given at the head of this letter in all correspondence.

Yours sincerely

Dave Palmer
Information Policy and Compliance Manager
University of East Anglia

Response to Freedom of Information Act 2000 request (FOI_18-109)

1. The name of your supplier for electricity and gas, for each year as far back as possible without incurring unreasonable cost or working time for you.

The University holds data about its suppliers of electricity and gas from 2006. The data is provided in the table below.

Year	Electricity Supplier	Gas Supplier
2006	E.ON Gaz De France Marketing Ltd Powergen	British Gas Trading Ltd Corona Energy Ltd Shell Gas Direct Ltd
2007	E.ON Gaz De France Marketing Ltd Powergen	British Gas Trading Ltd Corona Energy Ltd NPOWER Shell Gas Direct Ltd
2008	E.ON Total Gas & Power Ltd Gaz De France Marketing Ltd Powergen	British Gas Trading Ltd Corona Energy Ltd NPOWER Shell Gas Direct Ltd Wingas UK Ltd
2009	E.ON Southern Electric NPOWER Scottish & Southern Energy PLC Total Gas & Power Ltd Gaz De France Marketing Ltd GDF Suez Marketing Ltd	British Gas Trading Ltd Corona Energy Ltd NPOWER Shell Gas Direct Ltd Wingas UK Ltd
2010	E.ON Southern Electric NPOWER Scottish & Southern Energy PLC Total Gas & Power Ltd	British Gas Business British Gas Trading Ltd Corona Energy Ltd Gazprom Marketing and Trading Retail
2011	E.ON Southern Electric EDF Energy PLC (Domestic) NPOWER British Gas Business (Electricity) Scottish & Southern Energy PLC EDF Energy Total Gas & Power Ltd	British Gas Business British Gas Trading Ltd Corona Energy Ltd Corona Energy Retail 4 Ltd EDF Energy PLC (Domestic) Gazprom Marketing and Trading Retail
2012	Southern Electric EDF Energy PLC (Domestic) NPOWER British Gas Business (Electricity) Scottish & Southern Energy PLC EDF Energy Total Gas & Power Ltd	British Gas Business British Gas Trading Ltd Corona Energy Retail 4 Ltd EDF Energy PLC (Domestic) Gazprom Marketing and Trading Retail

		NPOWER Southern Electric
2013	Southern Electric NPOWER British Gas Business (Electricity) Scottish & Southern Energy PLC EDF Energy Total Gas & Power Ltd Haven Power Ltd Corona Energy Southern Electric	British Gas Business Corona Energy Retail 4 Ltd Gazprom Marketing and Trading Retail Southern Electric
2014	British Gas Business (Electricity) Haven Power Ltd Southern Electric	British Gas Trading Ltd Corona Energy Retail 4 Ltd Gazprom Marketing and Trading Retail Southern Electric Wingas UK Ltd
2015	British Gas Business (Electricity) Haven Power Ltd Southern Electric	British Gas Trading Ltd Southern Electric Wingas UK Ltd
2016	British Gas Business (Electricity) Haven Power Ltd Southern Electric Total Gas & Power	British Gas Trading Ltd Wingas UK Ltd
2017	British Gas Business (Electricity) Haven Power Ltd Southern Electric Total Gas & Power	British Gas Trading Ltd Corona Energy Retail 4 Ltd Gazprom Marketing and Trading Retail
2018	British Gas Business (Electricity) Haven Power Ltd Southern Electric Total Gas & Power	British Gas Trading Ltd Corona Energy Retail 4 Ltd Gazprom Marketing and Trading Retail

2. The unit rate and standing charge you are currently being charged by your energy supplier.

[Information not held – s.1(1)(a), Freedom of Information Act]

The University does not pay a standing charge. The University has a flex contract and unit charges change with market trading. The University pays 100% pass through charges.

3. The cost of your energy bill for the past 12 months, for electricity and gas.

Our annual spend for the last financial year is as follows:

- Electricity: £2,357,141.80
- Gas: £1,316,935.24