Information Services Directorate
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26 February 2018

Email: foi@uea.ac.uk
Tel: +44 (0) 1603 593 523
Fax: +44 (0) 1603 591 010
Web: http://www.uea.ac.uk

Dear
Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Information request (ref: FOI_18-027)
We have now considered your request of 31 January 2018 for information relating to
the utilisation of funding received from the Higher Education Funding Council for
England (HEFCE).
Our response is on pages 2-4 of this letter, together with a copy of your request.
On this occasion it is not possible to provide all the requested information. In line with
your rights under section 1(1)(a) of the Act to be informed whether information is
held, we confirm that the University does not hold information on outcomes of the
funding provided. Further information is on pages 2-4 of this letter.
We hope this information will meet your requirements, however if you are not
satisfied you have the right of appeal. If you wish to appeal, please set out in writing
your reasons for appealing and send to the above address. You must appeal within
60 calendar days of the date of this letter. Any appeal received after that date will not
be considered nor acknowledged. This policy has been reviewed and approved by
the Information Commissioner’s Office.
You also have a subsequent right of appeal to the Information Commissioner’s
Office. Further information is available on their website:
https://ico.org.uk/Global/contact us, or by telephone on 0303 123 1113.
Please note that any material over which UEA has copyright is released on the
understanding that you will comply with all relevant copyright rules regarding
reproduction and/or transmission of the information provided.
Please quote our reference given at the head of this letter in all correspondence.
Yours sincerely
Dave Palmer
Information Policy and Compliance Manager
University of East Anglia

Funding allocated:
Student facing support within UEA Schools and Faculties and partner colleges to
allow for specific focus on and additional needs of disabled students - £347,227.
Aim:
Academic and pastoral support of disabled students.
Timescale:
Ongoing
Metrics:
a)
b)
c)

Disabled student retention
Disabled student success (good honours)
Other detailed metrics around uptake and impact are currently being designed

Outcome:
[Information not held - s.1(1)(a), Freedom of Information Act]
Analysis approaches currently being developed.
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Funding allocated:
Proportion of non-cash costs of delivery disability support in UEA Student Support
Service - £23,744.
Aim:
Academic and pastoral support of disabled students.
Timescale:
Ongoing
Metrics:
a)
b)
c)

Disabled student retention
Disabled student success (good honours)
Other detailed metrics around uptake and impact are currently being designed

Outcome:
[Information not held - s.1(1)(a), Freedom of Information Act]
Analysis approaches currently being developed
---------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------Funding allocated:
Student facing support within UEA Schools and Faculties and partner colleges to
allow for specific focus on and additional needs of disabled students - £388,568.
Aim:
Academic and pastoral support of disabled students.

1

Please note that the figures provided for 2017/18 are a prediction of spend as the financial year is not
yet complete.

Timescale:
Ongoing
Metrics:
a)
b)
c)

Disabled student retention
Disabled student success (good honours)
Other detailed metrics around uptake and impact are currently being designed

Outcome:
[Information not held - s.1(1)(a), Freedom of Information Act]
Analysis approaches currently being developed,

