



University of East Anglia

Information Services Directorate

The Library
University of East Anglia
Norwich Research Park
Norwich NR4 7TJ
United Kingdom

Email: foi@uea.ac.uk
Tel: +44 (0) 1603 593 523
Fax: +44 (0) 1603 591 010
Web: <http://www.uea.ac.uk>

26 February 2018

Dear [REDACTED]

Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Information request (ref: FOI_18-029)

We have now considered your request of 07 February 2018 for information relating to LLB (undergraduate law) examination information.

Our response is on page 2 of this letter, together with a copy of your request.

On this occasion it is not possible to provide all the requested information. In line with your rights under section 1(1)(a) of the Act to be informed whether information is held, we confirm that the University does not hold information on individual examination dates. Further information is on page 2 of this letter.

We hope this information will meet your requirements, however if you are not satisfied you have the right of appeal. If you wish to appeal, please set out in writing your reasons for appealing and send to the above address. You must appeal within 60 calendar days of the date of this letter. Any appeal received after that date will not be considered nor acknowledged. This policy has been reviewed and approved by the Information Commissioner's Office.

You also have a subsequent right of appeal to the Information Commissioner's Office. Further information is available on their website:

https://ico.org.uk/Global/contact_us, or by telephone on 0303 123 1113.

Please note that any material over which UEA has copyright is released on the understanding that you will comply with all relevant copyright rules regarding reproduction and/or transmission of the information provided.

Please quote our reference given at the head of this letter in all correspondence.

Yours sincerely

Dave Palmer
Information Policy and Compliance Manager
University of East Anglia

Response to Freedom of Information Act 2000 request (FOI_18-029)

1. For each of the LLB (undergraduate law) subjects taught at the University the dates of examinations taking place between March 1st and July 15th 2018. If the University does not currently hold information about the precise exam dates then please provide the most precise information currently held regarding the dates of the exam period or periods during which the LLB (undergraduate law) examinations will take place.

[Information not held - s.1(1)(a), Freedom of Information Act]

The UEA examination (assessment) period is 21 May to 15 June 2018. Information pertaining to individual exams has not yet been released to the University.

2. A list of those LLB (undergraduate law) subjects, if any, which are NOT assessed by examination between March 1st and July 15th 2018.

The following subjects will not be assessed by examination:

- Law in Practice
- Jurisprudence
- US Constitutional Methods

3. (a) The LLB (undergraduate law) term dates for academic year 2017 - 2018 and (b) the dates on which teaching ends each term.

The LLB term dates are as follows. For each semester teaching takes place up until and including the last day of term.

Semester 1	25 September 2017 to 15 December 2017
Semester 2	15 January 2018 to 16 March 2018
Semester 2 continues	16 April 2018 to 18 May 2018