Information Services Directorate
The L brary
University of East Anglia
Norwich Research Park
Norwich NR4 7TJ
United Kingdom

11 August 2017

Email: foi@uea.ac.uk
Tel: +44 (0) 1603 593 523
Fax: +44 (0) 1603 591 010
Web: http://www.uea.ac.uk

Dear
Freedom of Information Act 2000 – Information request (ref: FOI_17-181)
We have now considered your request of 17 July 2017 for the following information:
1) A list of the number of students who have been sanctioned by your
university in academic year 2014/15 for breaching the codes of practice
and/or bringing the university into disrepute through anti-social behaviour,
what they were sanctioned for (ie. repeated noise complaints), and what
the sanction involved (ie. a fine - and if so, what amount - or removal from
their course);
2) A list of the number of students who have been sanctioned by your
university in academic year 2015/16 for breaching the codes of practice
and/or bringing the university into disrepute through anti-social behaviour,
what they were sanctioned for (ie. repeated noise complaints), and what
the sanction involved (ie. a fine - and if so, what amount - or removal from
their course); and
3) A list of the number of students who have been sanctioned by your
university in academic year 2016/17 for breaching the codes of practice
and/or bringing the university into disrepute through anti-social behaviour,
what they were sanctioned for (ie. repeated noise complaints), and what
the sanction involved (ie. a fine - and if so, what amount - or removal from
their course).
Our response is within the attached file entitled FOI_17-181 Appendix A. Please note
that in order to ensure we do not inadvertently disclose personal data, we have
standardised some of the reasons for the imposition of a penalty.
Any blank values in the ‘Penalty’ field within the Appendix simply indicate that data
was not recorded and that we do not hold this information, and should not be taken
as an indication that no penalty was imposed.
We hope this information will meet your requirements, however if you are not
satisfied you have the right of appeal. If you wish to appeal, please set out in writing
your reasons for appealing and send to the above address. You must appeal within
60 calendar days of the date of this letter. Any appeal received after that date will not
be considered nor acknowledged. This policy has been reviewed and approved by
the Information Commissioner’s Office.
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You also have a subsequent right of appeal to the Information Commissioner’s
Office. Further information is available on their website:
https://ico.org.uk/Global/contact us, or by telephone on 0303 123 1113.
Please note that any material over which UEA has copyright is released on the
understanding that you will comply with all relevant copyright rules regarding
reproduction and/or transmission of the information provided.
Please quote our reference given at the head of this letter in all correspondence.
Yours sincerely
Dave Palmer
Information Policy and Compliance Manager
University of East Anglia
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